M Gmail M Jane Smtih <smithmjgw@gmail.com>
EXHIBIT 3

Re: Mel McNulty

Camille McDaniel <camillepdx@yahoo.com> Wed, Nov 29 at 1:50 PM
Reply-To: Camille McDaniel <camillepdx@yahoo.coms

To: Raindrop Chapter <raindropnews@gmail.com>, M. Jane Smtih <smithmjgw@gmail.com:

Sounds good!
Jane, see above,

Camille McDaniel

On Wednesday, November 29, 2023 at 10:01:02 AM PST, Raindrop Chapter
<raindropnews@gmail.com> wrote:
No.. | emailed her on the 20th.. so far no response.

Let's just let it renew for 2024, | will reach out again, but | will be watching. if she pays
again 1 will catch and refund that one!

On Mon, Nov 27, 2023 at 1:40 PM Camille McDaniel <camillepdx@yahoo.com> wrote:
Any word back from Mel McNulty regarding her double payment? Are we applying it
to 20247

Camille

On Monday, November 20, 2023 at 08:34:20 AM PST, Camille McDaniel
<camillepdx@yahoo.com> wrote:

That would be great if you could contact her.



Camille
Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Mon, Nov 20, 2023 at 7:33 AM, Raindrop Chapter
<raindropnews @gmail.com> wrote:

Camille,

On April 14, 2023 Mel McNulty paid for membership twice. One right after the
other.

| do not know how it was missed! Sorry! 1do not see that | pointed that out at the
time, nor did | send you two emails regarding each payment. | am so sorry, this is
totally on me.

| can reach out and ask if she is planning on renewing, and if so, we can credit her
with the duplicate payment, or if she would like a refund?

OR would you rather do it? Please let me know.

[Quoted text hidden]



